Martin, Thornton E
“

From: Coccari, Gene M

Sent: Monday, August 15, 2016 3:07 PM
To: Martin, Thornton E

Subject: Elk Valley Pet Crematorium

Hello-

I have been to the Elks Hills Memorial Park on Rt. 119, one half mile above Big Chimney. They have not
started construction at this time. The location of the crematory sets just outside the cemetery on land owned
by the applicant. The nearest residence is also owned by the applicant. The site appears suitable for a pet
crematory. Thanks!

Gene M. Coccari

Environmental Resource Analyst

WV Department of Environmental Protection
Small Business Assistance Program

601 57th Street, SE

Charleston, WV 25304
gene.m.coccari@wv.gov

ph: (304) 926-0499 ext. 1245

fax: (304) 926-0479
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Martin, Thornton E

From: Martin, Thornton E

Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2016 2:11 PM

To: 'Elizabeth Smith'

Cc: McKeone, Beverly D

Subject: WV DAQ NSR Permit Application Complete for Elk Valley Pet Crematorium, LLC (Big
Chimney)

RE: Application Status: Complete
Elk Valley Pet Crematorium, LLC (Big Chimney)
Permit Application R13-3329
Plant ID No. 039-00672

Mr. McLaughlin:

Your application for a Construction permit for the Big Chimney facility was received by this Division on June
30, 2016 and assigned to the writer for review. Upon receipt of your Affidavit of Publication, July 18, 2016 and
review of said application, it has been determined that the application is complete and, therefore, the statutory
review period commenced on July 27, 2016.

In the case of this application, the agency believes it will take approximately 90 days to make a final
permit determination.

This determination of completeness shall not relieve the permit applicant of the requirement to subsequently
submit, in a timely manner, any additional or corrected information deemed necessary for a final permit
determination.

Should you have any questions, please contact me at (304) 926-0499 ext.1212 or reply to this email.

Fhornton E. Matin Fr.
Permit Engineer

Division of Air Quality

601 57*" Street, SE
Charleston, WV 25304
Phone: 304-926-0499 X1212
Fax: 304-926-0479
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Martin, Thornton E
\

From: Elizabeth Smith <elizabeth@elkhillsmemorialpark.com>
Sent: Monday, July 18, 2016 2:35 PM

To: Martin, Thornton E

Cc: Jkempmclaughlin@yahoo.com

Subject: RE: Elk Valley Pet Crematorium - legal ad
Attachments: File0002.PDF

Lee,

See attached.

Let me know what else you need.

Thank you,
Elizabeth Smith

From: Martin, Thornton E [mailto: Thornton.E.Martin@wv.gov]
Sent: Monday, July 18, 2016 11:02 AM

To: Elizabeth Smith

Subject: RE: Elk Valley Pet Crematorium - legal ad

Hi Elizabeth,
You can mail the original into our office or scan and email the document to me.

Best Regards,
Lee

From: Elizabeth Smith [mailto:elizabeth@elkhillsmemorialpark.com]

Sent: Monday, July 18, 2016 10:56 AM

To: Legal User <legals@cnpapers.com>

Cc: Martin, Thornton E <Thornton.E.Martin@wv.gov>; jkempmclaughlin@yahoo.com
Subject: RE: Elk Valley Pet Crematorium - legal ad

Nevermind, received this document in the mail today.
Thank you.

Lee,
Please tell me the best way to get you this.

Thank you,
Elizabeth Smith

From: Elizabeth Smith

Sent: Monday, July 18, 2016 9:34 AM Sm @dmm

To: 'Legal User' NON-COMEINENT] Al



Cc: Martin, Thornton E (Thornton.E.Martin@wy.gov); ‘jkempmclaughlin@yahoo.com'
Subject: RE: Elk Valley Pet Crematorium - legal ad

Hi Vanessa,

In order to proceed further, the WVDEP is requesting an “Original Affidavit of Publication”. Can you provide that for me
or let me know who at the paper can do that? | would be happy to pick it up as soon as possible.

Please contact me with questions.
Thank you,

Elizabeth M. Smith

Office Manaoger

Elk Hills Memorial Park, Inc.
T: (304) 965-5721

From: Legal User [mailto:legals@cnpapers.com]

Sent: Wednesday, July 06, 2016 7:43 AM
To: Elizabeth Smith
Subject: Re: Elk Valley Pet Crematorium - legal ad

Good morning,
Please find attached the proof for Ad #634060 set to run 7/8. The cost is $45.50.

Thank you,
Vanessa Adams

On 7/5/2016 2:46 PM, Elizabeth Smith wrote:

Vanessa,

Per our conversation, please see the attached legal advertisement for placement in the newspaper legal
section.

I will be paying for the ad, please send a bill to the address below.

My contact information is below.

The name of the company is Elk Valley Pet Crematorium, LLC. You may use the same P.O. Box number as
below to set up the company, if necessary.

Let me know what other questions you may have, please let me know the fee amount.

Elizabeth M. Smith
Office Manager

P.O. Box 12086
Charleston, WV 25302
T: (304) 546-9277
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Martin, Thornton E
“

From: Ward, Beth A

Sent: Tuesday, July 05, 2016 3:34 PM

To: Martin, Thornton E

Subject: ELK VALLEY PET CREMATORIUM LLC PERMIT APPLICATION FEE

This is the receipt for payment received from:

ELK VALLEY PET CREMATORIUM LLC, BIG CHIMNEY, CHECK NUMBER 15559, CHECK DATE 06/29/2016, $1,000.00
R13-3329 ID# 039-00672

OASIS Deposit CR 1700000994

Thank You!

Both Word

WV DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
BTO FISCAL

601 57™ STREET SE

CHARLESTON, WV 25304

(304) 926-0499 EXT 1846

beth.a.ward@wv.gov
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Adkins, Sandra K
ﬁ

From: Adkins, Sandra K

Sent: Tuesday, July 05, 2016 1:50 PM

To: ‘elizabeth@elkhillsmemorialpark.com'

Cc: McKeone, Beverly D; Martin, Thornton E

Subject: WV DAQ Permit Application Status for Elk Valley Pet Crematorium, LLC; Big Chimney

RE: Application Status
EIk Valley Pet Crematorium, LLC
Big Chimney
Facility ID No. 039-00672
Application No. R13-3329

Mr. McLaughlin,

Your application for construction permit for the Big Chimney location was received by this Division on
June 30, 2016, and was assigned to Lee Martin. The following item was not included in the initial application
submittal:

Original affidavit for Class I legal advertisement not submitted.

This item is necessary for the assigned permit writer to continue the 30-day completeness review.

Within 30 days, you should receive a letter from Lee stating the status of the permit application and, if
complete, given an estimated time frame for the agency’s final action on the permit.

Any determination of completeness shall not relieve the permit applicant of the requirement to
subsequently submit, in a timely manner, any additional or corrected information deemed necessary for a final
permit decision.

Should you have any questions, please contact the assigned engineer, Lee Martin, at 304-926-0499,
extension 1212.
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