
ARFQ DEP2400000051 LINE
    MASON DIXON ENERGY 

SERVICES LLC   
    SOLID ROCK EXCAVATING 

INC   
    BLUE RIDGE CONSTRUCTION 

GROUP INC   
    POLINO CONTRACTING 

INC   

AML Northern Maintenance WV   
  1 18,750.00$                                    50,000.00$                                         20,000.00$                                                  25,000.00$                                       
  2 6,270.50$                                       8,750.00$                                            9,750.00$                                                     11,250.00$                                       
  3 4,685.25$                                       5,000.00$                                            5,125.00$                                                     6,750.00$                                          
  4 6,930.75$                                       14,625.00$                                         13,500.00$                                                  13,875.00$                                       
  5 19,411.50$                                    31,500.00$                                         30,750.00$                                                  31,500.00$                                       
  6 4,310.25$                                       5,875.00$                                            5,250.00$                                                     5,875.00$                                          
  7 3,750.00$                                       1,250.00$                                            1,500.00$                                                     4,000.00$                                          
  8 7,305.75$                                       13,875.00$                                         13,500.00$                                                  15,000.00$                                       
  9 1,000.00$                                       500.00$                                                250.00$                                                         1,500.00$                                          
  10 2,435.25$                                       4,375.00$                                            4,000.00$                                                     4,875.00$                                          
  11 1,374.10$                                       1,350.00$                                            1,250.00$                                                     2,100.00$                                          
  12 1,374.10$                                       1,350.00$                                            1,250.00$                                                     2,050.00$                                          
  13 974.10$                                           1,050.00$                                            1,250.00$                                                     1,450.00$                                          
  14 2,185.25$                                       3,750.00$                                            3,125.00$                                                     3,000.00$                                          
  15 2,260.25$                                       2,875.00$                                            3,125.00$                                                     3,875.00$                                          
  16 150.00$                                           2,000.00$                                            1,000.00$                                                     1,350.00$                                          
  17 2,435.25$                                       3,000.00$                                            4,000.00$                                                     3,625.00$                                          
  18 2,810.25$                                       3,250.00$                                            4,375.00$                                                     4,000.00$                                          
  19 3,900.00$                                       950.00$                                                3,750.00$                                                     4,250.00$                                          
  20 600.00$                                           3,000.00$                                            750.00$                                                         750.00$                                              
  21 2,600.00$                                       10,000.00$                                         3,000.00$                                                     2,500.00$                                          
  22 1,560.00$                                       3,750.00$                                            2,500.00$                                                     4,750.00$                                          
  23 1,500.00$                                       500.00$                                                1,500.00$                                                     1,000.00$                                          
  24 2,600.00$                                       1,500.00$                                            2,500.00$                                                     2,750.00$                                          
  25 1,000.00$                                       800.00$                                                1,000.00$                                                     2,750.00$                                          
  26 1,125.00$                                       500.00$                                                500.00$                                                         500.00$                                              
  27 1,220.00$                                       400.00$                                                1,000.00$                                                     1,300.00$                                          
  28 1,060.00$                                       1,500.00$                                            500.00$                                                         1,000.00$                                          
  29 900.00$                                           750.00$                                                400.00$                                                         500.00$                                              
  30 950.00$                                           750.00$                                                400.00$                                                         500.00$                                              
  31 6,250.00$                                       1,250.00$                                            2,500.00$                                                     1,500.00$                                          
  32 7,000.00$                                       1,000.00$                                            2,500.00$                                                     3,250.00$                                          
  33 1,920.00$                                       1,100.00$                                            1,000.00$                                                     2,800.00$                                          
  34 13,750.00$                                    10,000.00$                                         11,250.00$                                                  15,000.00$                                       
  35 19,000.00$                                    10,000.00$                                         12,500.00$                                                  17,500.00$                                       
  36 9,750.00$                                       10,000.00$                                         11,250.00$                                                  15,000.00$                                       
  37 400.00$                                           650.00$                                                500.00$                                                         150.00$                                              
  38 900.00$                                           500.00$                                                200.00$                                                         4,500.00$                                          
  39 9,000.00$                                       2,500.00$                                            2,000.00$                                                     14,000.00$                                       
  40 10,200.00$                                    2,500.00$                                            2,000.00$                                                     14,000.00$                                       
  41 480.00$                                           120.00$                                                240.00$                                                         600.00$                                              
  42 760.00$                                           1,060.00$                                            1,400.00$                                                     1,000.00$                                          
  43 1,200.00$                                       2,800.00$                                            1,400.00$                                                     1,400.00$                                          
  44 5,000.00$                                       4,000.00$                                            5,000.00$                                                     7,000.00$                                          
  45 5,500.00$                                       4,200.00$                                            5,500.00$                                                     8,500.00$                                          
  46 4,500.00$                                       4,000.00$                                            5,000.00$                                                     6,500.00$                                          
  47 10,000.00$                                    10,000.00$                                         12,500.00$                                                  16,250.00$                                       
  48 10,000.00$                                    10,500.00$                                         12,000.00$                                                  16,250.00$                                       
  49 37,500.00$                                    21,000.00$                                         24,000.00$                                                  32,500.00$                                       
  50 20,000.00$                                    19,000.00$                                         22,500.00$                                                  27,500.00$                                       
  51 10,500.00$                                    13,750.00$                                         13,750.00$                                                  26,250.00$                                       
  52 20,500.00$                                    30,000.00$                                         27,500.00$                                                  52,500.00$                                       
  53 4,775.00$                                       3,000.00$                                            3,000.00$                                                     3,750.00$                                          
  54 4,900.00$                                       3,750.00$                                            3,500.00$                                                     5,000.00$                                          
  55 7,000.00$                                       6,250.00$                                            7,500.00$                                                     8,750.00$                                          
  56 7,750.00$                                       7,000.00$                                            8,000.00$                                                     10,000.00$                                       
  57 1,300.00$                                       2,000.00$                                            1,500.00$                                                     1,500.00$                                          
  58 450.00$                                           750.00$                                                450.00$                                                         875.00$                                              
  59 700.00$                                           1,250.00$                                            750.00$                                                         1,500.00$                                          
  60 1,375.00$                                       2,000.00$                                            1,250.00$                                                     2,500.00$                                          
  61 200.00$                                           500.00$                                                75.00$                                                            250.00$                                              
  62 250.00$                                           500.00$                                                100.00$                                                         500.00$                                              
  63 500.00$                                           300.00$                                                300.00$                                                         1,000.00$                                          
  64 4,500.00$                                       2,500.00$                                            600.00$                                                         3,000.00$                                          
  65 2,250.00$                                       1,425.00$                                            1,500.00$                                                     2,500.00$                                          
  66 250.00$                                           950.00$                                                500.00$                                                         320.00$                                              
  67 930.00$                                           1,400.00$                                            700.00$                                                         120.00$                                              
  68 200.00$                                           1,400.00$                                            2,500.00$                                                     60.00$                                                
  69 500.00$                                           1,750.00$                                            1,000.00$                                                     6,650.00$                                          
  70 250.00$                                           1,875.00$                                            500.00$                                                         150.00$                                              
  71 300.00$                                           1,500.00$                                            1,000.00$                                                     350.00$                                              
  72 150.00$                                           2,000.00$                                            2,000.00$                                                     150.00$                                              
  73 125.00$                                           1,000.00$                                            1,000.00$                                                     75.00$                                                
  74 100.00$                                           200.00$                                                200.00$                                                         15.00$                                                
  75 28,500.00$                                    62,500.00$                                         90,000.00$                                                  75,000.00$                                       
  76 15,000.00$                                    2,500.00$                                            3,125.00$                                                     2,500.00$                                          
  77 2,500.00$                                       500.00$                                                1,000.00$                                                     3,500.00$                                          
  78 75,000.00$                                    25,000.00$                                         31,250.00$                                                  62,500.00$                                       
  79 600.00$                                           200.00$                                                500.00$                                                         500.00$                                              
  80 800.00$                                           1,350.00$                                            800.00$                                                         2,800.00$                                          
  81 2,500.00$                                       1,500.00$                                            250.00$                                                         7,000.00$                                          
  82 1,725.00$                                       1,800.00$                                            1,725.00$                                                     1,800.00$                                          
  83 NO BID -$                                                        NO BID -$                                                      
  84 NO BID -$                                                        NO BID -$                                                      
  85 NO BID -$                                                        NO BID -$                                                      
  86 NO BID -$                                                        NO BID -$                                                      
  87 NO BID -$                                                        NO BID -$                                                      

  Total Bid   476,917.55$                                 477,355.00$                                      483,865.00$                                               652,190.00$                                    


